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Water/Sewer System Supplies 7125/2007
PWU-0819 10:00 AM
Bid Tabulation
Ziebell Water Service HD Waterworks
Mid American Water, | Products, Elk Grove | Supply, Carol Stream, Water Products,

Category Aurora, IL Village, IL IL Aurora, IL
I-Valves/Water NoBid | $ 5130.001 % 402317 | § 5,034.00
lI-Couplings/Water No Bid | $ 487.00 | $ 397.27 No Bid
lll-End Couplings / Water NoBid | $ 830.00| % 673.17 No Bid
IV-Pipe/Water $ 163380 % 1,975.00 [ $ 1,762.80 | $ 1,753.20
V-Castings/Water No Bid | $ 32310 [ $ 308.90 | $ 201.00
VI-Repair Sleeves/Water NoBid | $ 5180.00| $ 5,058.05 No Bid
VlI-Brass Fittings / Water NoBid | $ 1,800.35 | % 1,693.87 No Bid
VIil-Fittings/Sewer $ 171350 | 1,843.85| $ 151095 § 1,970.28
IX-Couplings/Sewer $ 48400 $ 41740 $ 365.73 No Bid
X-Pipe/Sewer $ 1,351.00 | $ 1220801 $ 1,103.48 | § 1,329.30
Xl-Fire Hydrant
Extension/Repair Kits $ 823.001 % 775.00 | $ 71719 $ 841.00
XlI-Fire Hydrants $ 5367.00 | $ 5774.00 | § 5,5608.39 | $ 5,753.00
Xlll-Fire Hydrants Parts | $ 6,720.60 | $ 5,253.00 | $ 6,083.00 | $ 6,287.90

Total Bid $23,169.67

As Read No Total $31,099.50 $30,074.80 | No Bid on 5 Categories

Total Bid

As Corrected $ 18,092.90 | $ 31,099.50 | $ 30,106.06 | $ 23,169.68
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