DISTRICT All
VILLAGE OF LOMBARD / / % 4 7 c}J
REQUEST FOR BOARD OF TRUSTEES ACTION
For Inclusion on Board Agenda
Bids and Proposals

TO President and Village Board of Trustees

FROM David A. Hulseberg, Village Managér

DATE July 29, 2011 Agenda Date August 18, 2011
TITLE Snow & Debris Hauling Bid

SUBMITTED BY:  Angela M. Podesta, Utilities Superintendent ?\\\)\’Q

RESULTS: :
Date Bids Were Published 7/6/11 Bidding Closed 7/21/11
Total Number of Bids Received 5 :
Total Number of Bidders Meeting Specifications 5
Bid Security Required Yes X No
Performance Bond Required Yes X No
Were Any Bids Withdrawn Yes X No
Explanation:
Waiver of Bids Requested? : Yes X No
If yes, explain:
Award Recommended to Lowest X Yes No
Responsible Bidder?
If no, explain:
FISCAL IMPACT:
Snow & Material Hauling Debris Hauling & Disposal |  Snow Removal
Budget $10,500.00 $93,000.00 $0.00
Award $5,460.00 $62,690.00 $1,540.00

BACKGROUND/RECOMMENDATION:

Award a contract in an amount not to exceed $64,620.00 for Debris Hauling & Disposal and Snow
Removal to DAS Enterprises of Elk Grove, IL and award a contract in an amount not to exceed
$5,460.00 to Berkeley Trucking of Elmhurst, IL.

Has Recommended Bidder Worked for Village Previously __Yes X No

If yes, was quality of work acceptable _Yes __ No
Was item bid in accordance with Public Act 85-1295? X Yes __ No
Waiver of bids - Public Act 85-1295 does not apply __Yes

REVIEW (as needed):

Village Attorney XX Date

Finance Director XX ' Date

Village Manager XX Date

NOTE: All materials must be submitted to and approved by the Village Manager's Office by 4:30 pm,
Wednesday, prior to the Board Agenda distribution.




MEMORANDUM

To: David A. Hulseburg, Village Manager
Through: Carl S. Goldsmith, Director of Public Works
From: Angela M. Podesta, Utilities Superintendent NJ\
Date: July 29, 2011

Subject: Snow & Debris Hauling Bid

Background

The Snow & Debris Hauling bid was broken into three categories: snow and material hauling, debris
hauling and disposal and lastly, snow removal. The snow and material hauling category includes
providing labor and equipment for hauling the snow from windrow operations and other miscellaneous
large scale material hauling within the Village. The debris hauling and disposal category includes
hauling and disposal of debris from utility digs, paving operations and fall street sweeping operations.
The debris hauling and disposal category includes for the disposal of debris qualifying as clean
construction debris and also special waste. Lastly, the snow removal category provides labor and
equipment such as front end loaders, to assist the Village in snow removal operations. The February,
2011 snow storm was the first time the Village used contractors to assist in snow removal operations.
All quantities are estimated based upon past experience and the bids were evaluated per each category.

Proposals were sent to nine (9) companies. Bids were opened on July 21, 2011. Five (5) bids were
submitted as follows:

Company Snow & Material | Debris Hauling & Snow Removal
Hauling Disposal

DAS Enterprises $7,303.00 $62,690.00 $1,540.00
Elk Grove, IL
Heritage Logistics $6,440.00 $147,160.00 $1,552.50
Warrenville, IL
Nagel Trucking $7,336.00 $102,090.00 $2,220.00
Batavia, IL
Berkeley Trucking $5,460.00 $80,650.00 No Bid
Elmhurst, IL
KOZ Trucking $6,514.00 $73,760.00 $2,220.00
Medinah, IL

The bid tabulation is attached. Staff contacted the performance references for DAS Enterprises and
Berkeley Trucking and found them to be acceptable. Therefore, staff recommends that DAS Enterprises
be awarded a contract for the Debris Hauling & Disposal and Snow Removal categories, and Berkeley
Trucking be awarded a contract for Snow & Material Hauling category.

Recommendation

Staff recommends the Board of Trustees award a contract in an amount not to exceed $64,620.00 for
Debris Hauling & Disposal and Snow Removal to DAS Enterprises of Elk Grove, IL and award a
contract in an amount not to exceed $5,460.00 to Berkeley Trucking of Elmhurst, IL. Please submit this
recommendation to the Board of Trustees for their approval at the August 18, 2011 meeting.

U:\My Documents\Word\BIDDOC\Snow & Debris HaulingBOT Memo.doc



PROJECT FILE NAME: Snow & Debris Hauling

PROJECT NO.: PWO-1203
DATE: July 21, 2011
TIME: 10:00am DAS Enterprises, Inc Heritage Logistics, LLC Nagel Trucking & Materials |Berkeley Trucking, Inc Koz Trucking & Sons SNOW & MATERIAL
TABULATED BY: Angela Podesta 224 E. Devon Ave. 28361 Diehl Road Unit B #338 |1043 Paramount Pkwy 747 S. Rt. 83 22W335 Temple Dr HAULING
Budget  [Elk Grove, IL Warrenville, IL 60555 Batavia, IL_60510 Eimhurst, IL 60126 Medinah, IL 60157 (Average)
NO ITEM QUAN  UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
SNOW & MATERIAL HAULING PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
Hourly Rate (Straight
Time) for one (1) semi-
1 |trailer truck portal to portal 16| HOUR 85.00 $1,360.00 92.00 $1,472.00 94,00 $1,504.00 78.00 $1,248.00 86.00 $1,376.00 87.00 $1,392.00
Hourly Rate (Overtime
Time) for one (1) semi-
2 |trailer truck portal to portal 38| HOUR 105.00 $3,990.00 92.00 $3,496.00 108.00 $4,104.00 78.00 $2,964.00 91.00 $3,458.00 94.80 $3,602.40
Hourly Rate
(Sunday/Holiday) for one
(1) semi-trailer truck portal :
3 |[to portal 16| HOUR 105.00 $1,680.00 92.00 $1,472.00 108.00 $1,728.00 78.00 $1,248.00 105.00 $1,680.00 97.60 $1,561.60
SNOW & MATERIAL
HAULING AS READ: $7,030.00 $6,440.00 $7,336.00 $5,460.00 $6,514.00
TOTAL BID AS CORRECTEL $10,500.00 $7,030.00 $6,440.00 $7,336.00 $5,460.00 $6,514.00 $6,556.00
DAS Enterprises, Inc Heritage Logistics, LLC Nagel Trucking & Materials |Berkeley Trucking, Inc Koz Trucking & Sons DEBRIS HAULING &
224 E. Devon Ave. 28361 Dieht Road Unit B #338 |1043 Paramount Pkwy 747 S. Rt. 83 22W335 Temple Dr DISPOSAL PRICES
Budget Elk Grove, IL Warrenville, IL 60555 Batavia, IL 60510 Elmhurst, IL 60126 Medinah, IL 60157 (Average)
NO ITEM QUAN  UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
DEBRIS HAULING & DISPOSAL PRICES PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1 |Clean Fill per load 10§ HOUR 206.00 $2,060.00 296.00 $2,960.00 219.00 $2,190.00 180.00 $1,800.00 220.00 $2,200.00 224.20 $2,242.00
2 jAsphalt per load 40| HOUR 216.00 $8,640.00 296.00 $11,840.00 249.00 $9,960.00 190.00 $7,600.00 205.00 $8,200.00 231.20 $9,248.00
3 |Concrete per load 10| HOUR 165.00 $1,650.00 162.00 $1,620.00 189.00 $1,890.00 150.00 $1,500.00 170.00 $1,700.00 167.20 $1,672.00
4 [Mixed Debris per load 125} HOUR 206.00] $25,750.00 296.00 $37,000.00 239.00] $29,875.00 185.00f $23,125.00 235.00] $29,375.00 232.20 $29,025.00
5 |Street Sweeping per load 35| HOUR 414.00| $14,490.00 1,488.00 $52,080.00 495.00{ $17,325.00 810.00] $28,350.00 499.00| $17,465.00 741.20 $25,942.00
6 {Special Waste 25| HOUR 298.00 $7,450.00 1,488.00 $37,200.00 1,510.001 $37,750.00 595.00( $14,875.00 500.00} $12,500.00 878.20 $21,955.00
7 {Too Wet to Handle 10{ HOUR 265.00 $2,650.00 446.00 $4,460.00 310.00 $3,100.00 340.00 $3,400.00 232.00 $2,320.00 318.60 $3,186.00
DEBRIS HAULING &
DISPOSAL PRICES AS READ: $62,690.00 $147,160.00 $102,090.00 $80,650.00 $73,760.00
TOTAL BID AS CORRECTEL $93,000.00 $62,690.00 $147,160.00 $102,090.00 $80,650.00 $73,760.00 $13,162.00
DAS Enterprises, Inc Heritage Logistics Nagel Trucking & Materials [Berkeley Trucking, Inc Koz Trucking & Sons SNOW REMOVAL
224 E. Devon Ave. 28361 Diehl Road Unit B #338 1043 Paramount Pkwy 747 S. Rt. 83 22W335 Temple Dr )
Budget Elk Grove, IL Warrenville, IL 60555 Batavia, IL 60510 Elmhurst, IL 60126 Medinah, IL 60157 (Average)
NO ITEM QUAN  UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
SNOW REMOVAL PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
Hourly Rate (Straight
Time) for one (1) semi-
1 |trailer truck portal to portal 10} HOUR 125.00 $1,250.00 115.00 $1,150.00 180.00 $1,800.00 No Bid 180.00 $1,800.00 150.00 $1,500.00
Hourly Rate (Overtime
Time) for one (1) semi-
2 |trailer truck portal to portal 1§ HOUR 145.00 $145.00 172.50 $172.50 210.00 $210.00 No Bid 210.00 $210.00 184.38 $184.38
Hourly Rate
(Sunday/Holiday) for one
(1) semi-trailer truck portal
3 |to portal 1} HOUR 145.00 $145.00 230.00 $230.00 210.00 $210.00 No Bid 210.00 $210.00 198.75 $198.75
SNOW REMOVAL AS READ: $1,540.00 $1,552.50 $2,220.00 No Bid $2,220.00
TOTAL BID AS CORRECTEL $0.00 $1,540.00 $1,552.50 $2,220.00 No Bid $2,220.00 $1,883.13
ENUU5 (TZ/96)

Page 1




