LEGISTAR: 260221
DISTRICT - ALL

VILLAGE OF LOMBARD
REQUEST FOR BOARD OF TRUSTEES ACTION
For Inclusion on Board Agenda

Bids and Proposals
TO : President and Village Board of Trustees
FROM : Nicole Aranas, Village Manager
DATE June 8, 2026 Agenda Date: June 18, 2026
TITLE : Bid Opening For: Equipment and upfit of two service bodies

SUBMITTED BY: Robert LaMontagna, Operations Superintendentw

RESULTS:

Date Bids Were Published

Bidding Closed e

Total Number of Bids Received

Total Number of Bidders Meeting Specifications

Bid Security Required Yes X No
Performance Bond Required Yes X No

Were Any Bids Withdrawn Yes X No
Explanation:

Waiver of Bids Requested? X Yes No
If yes, explain: Request for proposals were solicited from several local upfitters
Award Recommended to Lowest X Yes No
Responsible Bidder?

If no, explain:

FISCAL IMPACT:
Engineer's estimate/budget estimate $190.000
Amount of Award $215.278

BACKGROUND/RECOMMENDATION:
Staff seeks board approval to award a contract to Knapheide Truck Equipment Center Chicago of
McHenry (IL) in the amount of $215,278 for the equipment and upfit of two service bodies

Has Recommended Bidder Worked for Village Previously X Yes __ No
If yes, was quality of work acceptable X Yes _ No
REVIEW (as needed):

Village Attorney XX Date

Finance Director XX Date

Village Manager XX Date

NOTE: All materials must be submitted to and approved by the Village Manager's Office by 4:30 pm, Wednesday,
prior to the Board Agenda distribution.




To: Village President and Board of Trustees

Through: Carl S. Goldsmith, Director of Public Worksﬁ.

From: Robert LaMontagna, Operations Superintenden@
Date: June 8, 2026
Subject: Underground Utilities Service Truck Replacement

The FY 2026 fleet replacement schedule includes replacement of two service trucks in the
Underground Utilities fleet, WT434 and WT435. Underground Utilities and Fleet Services staff
worked to develop specifications for the new truck that would meet the current as well as future
needs this vehicle would have to fulfill. Proposals were then requested from local upfitters to
build these utility trucks on 2027 Ford F-550 chassis. The chart below includes the vendors and
their proposals. Of the two vendors that provided quotes, Knapheide Truck Equipment Center
Chicago provided the lowest price of $215,278 for the equipment and installation on two chassis
provided by the Village. The purchase of two 2027 Ford F-550 chassis will be a separate item
for consideration at a cost of $111,722. Total cost for the two complete trucks will be $327,000
and will be funded from the vehicle reserve fund. The two vehicles being replaced will be
declared surplus on a separate action item as well.

Body Manufacture Upfitter
Knapheide | Regional Monroe | Holman | EJ Regional
Equipment
Reading no bid | no bid
Maintainer no bid
Knapheide § 215278 | § 241,218
EBY no bid

Staff recommends the Board of Trustees waive the competitive bid process and award a
contract to Knapheide Truck Equipment Center Chicago of McHenry (IL) in the amount of
$215,278 for the equipment and upfit of two service bodies and equipment on Ford F-550
chassis provided to them by the Village of Lombard. Please submit this item to the Village
Board for their consideration at the June 18, 2026 meeting.



ORDINANCE

ORDINANCE AUTHORIZING THE SALE AND/OR DISPOSAL
OF MUNICIPAL OWNED PERSONAL PROPERTY

WHEREAS, in the opinion of the Corporate Authorities of the Village of Lombard, it
is no longer necessary or useful to or in the best interest for the Village of Lombard to retain
the following described personal property:

Unit # Year Make Model Vin Number
WT434 2016 Ford F450 1FDUF4GY9GEA16127
WT435 2016 Ford F-550 1FDUF5GY3GEA16128

now owned by the Village of Lombard; and
WHEREAS, The Village routinely declares such type of personal property surplus and
the best interest of the Village of Lombard will be served by its sale and/or disposal.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE PRESIDENT AND BOARD
OF TRUSTEES OF THE VILLAGE OF LOMBARD, DU PAGE COUNTY, ILLINOIS,
as follows:

Section 1: Pursuant to 65 ILCS 5/11-76-4, the President and Board of Trustees find the
following described property:

i Unit # Year Make Model Vin Number
| WT434 2016 Ford F450 1FDUF4GY9GEA16127
i WT435 2016 Ford F-550 1FDUF5GY3GEA16128

now owned by the Village of Lombard is no longer necessary or useful to the Village of
Lombard and the best interest of Lombard will be served by its sale.

Section 2: Pursuant to said 65 ILCS 5/11-76-4, the Village President and Clerk are
hereby authorized and directed to sell and/or dispose of the aforementioned personal property
now owned by the Village of Lombard.

Section 3: This ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after its adoption
and approval as provided by law.

Passed on first reading this day of , 2025
First reading waived by action of the Board of Trustees this day of , 2025
Passed on second reading this day of , 2025

Ayes:




Ordinance No.
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Nays:

Absent:

Approved this day of , 2025

Anthony Puccio
Village President
ATTEST:

Ranya Elkhatib
Village Clerk



Seller: Knapheide Truck Equipment Center Chicago
APHEI 2600 W IL ROUTE 120

MCHENRY, IL 60051-4563

QUOTE: QU-79-
1063689-2

SINCE 1848 TP
1 (815) 385-2600 Quote Expiration:
www.knapheide.com 04/07/2026
Contact(s); Brett Wise (Outside Sales) Brett Wise (Inside Sales) Breft Wise
bwise58@knapheide.com bwise58@knapheide.com bwise58@knapheide.com

Customer: Lombard, Village Of

ID: 87232 Phone: 6306205919
Address: 255 E WILSON AVE Contact: Rob Lamontagna
ATTN: ACCOUNTS PAYABLE
LOMBARD, IL. 60148-3926 Email: lamontagna@villageoflombard.org
Description: KC132H2094 Custom Body/Boss Compressor System/Lighting
Quote Information: Delivery Information:
Customer Request Date: Total Price Includes F.0.B.:
Quote Completed Date: 05/28/2026 Ship Via:
Date: 05/28/2026 14:11 PM CDT Ship To: Lombard, Vililage Of
# of Units: 1 6306205919
255 E WILSON AVE

ATTN: ACCOUNTS PAYABLE
LOMBARD, IL 60148-3926

Vehicle Information:

Terms: NET 30 DAYS
Bid Spec:

Make: Ford Model: F-550 Year: 2026
Chassis Type: Chassis Cab Cab Type: Regular Cab to Axle: 84
Rear Axle Type: DRW Drivetrain: 4x2 Engine Size: 7.3
Fuel Type: Gas Transmission Type: Auto Wheelbase: 169
GVWR: 19500
Seq. Description Quantity Total
1 1 N KC132H2094 Canopy Body 1.00 46,728.41
OVERALL LENGTH: - - ------ 133-1/4" 1V = 34-1/4" in length x 54" high
OVERALL HEIGHT: - ------- 90" 2V = 21" in length x 40" HIGH
OVERALL WIDTH: ~-------- 94" H = 52-3/4" in length x 18-1/2" high
FLOORWIDTH: - - -------- 54" 3V = 25-1/4" in length x 40" high
SIDE COMPARTMENT HEIGHT: - - - - 40" STANDARD SHELVING: Includes (2) adjustable
SIDE COMPARTMENT DEPTH: - - - - 20" divider shelves each front and 2nd vertical
FLOOR HEIGHT: - - -~ =--~- 24" compartment, (1) adjustable divider shelf
ROOF SIDE HEIGHT: -~ ----- 50" each rear vertical compartment, (1) bolt-in

STREETSIDE COMPARTMENTATION: divider shelf for curbside horizontal

1V = 34-1/4" in length x 54" high compartment and (28) shelf dividers.

2V = 21" in length x 40" high (2) Fixed shelf per side, (1) on top of side pack

H =52-3/4" in length x 18-1/2" high and (1) in the interior of tapered roof section
3V = 25-1/4" in length x 40" high WARRANTY: Standard Knapheide Limited Warranty
CURBSIDE COMPARTMENTATION:

1Y Paint Knap White KC132 Interior and Exterior of body and cargo area painted
Knapheide white. Some touch up may be required by

distributor after shipment and handling.

1 N Ford 60"+CA Install Kit For use with wheel housing delete with 6" understructure.
1 N 2023 ford cab chas.fasfls

1Y Knapheide Power Locks Do not store flammable materials such as gasoline,
acetylene, propane, or cleaning fluids in body.

Electric locks may spark and cause an explosion which could

result in death or severe injury.

*Used in conjunction with standard master locks.

1 N LED Compartment Lights Shipped

1 N CR Side Mount Ladder Rack Side Mount

1 N Tailshelf w/Thru Comp 24" Tailshelf lowered so that doors can still operate.

1Y Tailshif/Bmpr Vise Socket

1 N Tailshlf/Bmpr Vise Table

1Y UB tailshif hitch reinf.

Quote 1063689-2 KNAPHEIBE
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2 N Cable Step Galva Grip 15"
1Y 3PT T-Handle Latches ILO NXG Rotary Latches
STREETSIDE (Left)
1Y Transverse Comprtmnt L1V
1Y Extend Cargo Floor L1V Extend floor to edge of body. Leave compartment above and
below cargo floor.
1Y Roll Up Dr Vert Cmpt L1V aluminun shutter type door.
1Y Tb transverse top opn lid
1Y Raised Compart 54"H 1V Raise L1V 13" to fit Wach's
1Y Adjustable Shelf LH
CURBSIDE (Right)
1Y 22"D Comprts ILO 18"D R1V
1Y Roll Up Dr Vert Compt R1V aluminun shutter type door.
1 N Ctech 6 Drawer unit R2V 13w x 29.82h x 17.5d
Fire Engine Red
Telescoping Shelf
Shelf Slot Spacing : 8.75
MotionLatch Drawers
(3)3 inch [Liner]
(2)5 inch [Liner]
7 inch [Liner]
1Y Raised Compart 54"H R1V Standard shelving and shelf clips to remain.
1 1Y Tb add gas assists 1 pair add gas assists to transverse top opening compartment
2 1Y KC Roll Up Rear Door standard rear doors.
1Y Transv Open Both Sides
1Y KC Straight ILO Tapered sides. This option includes making the curb side rear
Installed

2 Boss PTO-Operated Under-Deck Air Compressor System with Hydraulic Tool Circuit & Hose Reel with Generator 1.00 32,471.55
and Wach's machine.

Chicago Style Air Fitting 1" Installed rea body
Installed

3 LED Amber Lighting Package 1.00 5,910.72
15" Mini Lightbar Mounted in Front of Body

2- Front Girill

4- Rear of Body

4- LED Scene Lights. Two per side.

51" LED Directional Light Mounted on Top Rear Body
2-Flood Lights Mounted to rear of body

Installed

4 HOSE REEL HYDRAULIC 1/2 X 50FT 1.00 1,688.00
INSTALLED

5 Cone Holder, Buyers TCH10H 1.00 99.32
22" High

Horizontal Mount
Black Powder Coated Steel
Installed on Rear Bumper Street Side

6 Wall-Mounted Hanging Patio 1500W Infrared Heater 1.00 410.00
Installed Inside Body on Front Wall

7 Miscellaneous Material, Steel Hooks inside body 4.00 200.00
8 Spray Liner, Spray Liner, Rear Bumper Top and Inside Load Space 1.00 1,480.00
9 6" Mechanics Vise, Wilton 746 Tradesman 21500 1.00 295.00

5,500lb Clamping Force

Base Type: Swivel

Powder Coated Paint

Jaw Material: Steel

Jaw Opening: 5-3/4"

Jaw Type: Serrated

Jaw Width: 6"

Material: Ductile iron
Mounting Type: Bolted-Down
Number of Mounting Points: 4
Pipe Capacity: 1/4" to 3-1/2"
Rotation Angle: 360 Degree
Throat Depth: 4-1/8"

17.7" Long x 11" Wide x 10.8" High
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Weight: 69lbs

10 Electric Cord Reel 1.00 706.00
Installed in RR compartment
Total does not include any applicable taxes or transportation charges unless specifically noted herein: Subtotal: $89,989.00
Total: $89,989.00
Customer PO Total Price

*Credit Card Policy: Knapheide accepts MasterCard, American Express, Visa and Discover cards for payment. Invoices greater than or equal to $10,000
will include a 3% handling fee when paid by credit card beginning May 4, 2026.

Liability for product on Knapheide property with terms Customer Pickup: Product must be picked up within (14) days of notification of product
available for customer pickup. Customer shall assume all responsibility for the Product, including but not limited to damage due to Acts of God or vandalism
following 14 days of notification of product available for Customer pickup. Knapheide reserves the right to assess a storage fee of $25/day for each day
goods remain on Knapheide property beyond {14) days of notification of product available for Customer pickup.

Cancellation Policy: All cancellation requests must be made in writing. Upon any request for cancellation, any costs incurred by Knapheide during the
fulfiliment of Orders placed pursuant to this Quote shall be paid at 100%. Payments for cancellation are due in full at time of cancellation and/or upon
cancellation of installation. Quoted prices are only guaranteed for orders placed as of the date specified on the Quote unless otherwise stated herein.

Payment Policy: Payment Terms are due upon receipt of signed quote unless prior credit agreement has been established at the time of order. Payment
terms for customers with an established credit account will be Net 30 from date of invoice. Seller has right to assess late charges at 1.5% per month on all
invoices that are 60 days or more past due.

Pricing Policy: All prices reflect the latest price in U.S. Dollars. Any order placed pursuant to this Quote shall be subject to these Terms and Conditions
contained herein. These Conditions shall serve to exclude all other terms or conditions of purchase or other conflicting terms or conditions which may be
issued, provided or referred to by Customer, all of which are hereby disclaimed or rejected, except insofar as any terms are expressly accepted in writing
with an Authorized Knapheide Representative’s written signature. Pricing quoted applies to chassis make/model originally provided and quantity quoted.
Any deviation therefrom may resuit in price change. In addition, additional costs may be incurred in the process of fulfilling orders placed pursuant to this
Quote and Knapheide reserves the right to adjust costs accordingly, including but not limited to, reprogramming fees, etc. Orders are subject to all
applicable state, local and federal excise taxes. Applicable taxes will be applied on final biling to customer upon completion of order. Seller must be in
possession of the vehicle for this order within 90 days of quote acceptance or the order can be subject to price adjustments due to cost increases for
materials, labor, and shop supplies.

Return Policy: All sales are final. Purchased parts or products are non-returnable.

By signing and accepting this quotation, Customer agrees to accept Knapheide Truck Equipment Center Chicago terms and
conditions as stated above.

Customer Signature Print Name Title Date

Dealer Code Dealership Location

If the chassis is customer supplied, Knapheide
may require a chassis spec sheet

VIN
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KNAPH EIDE Seller:

SINCE 1848

Knapheide Truck Equipment Center Chicago

2600 W IL ROUTE 120
MCHENRY, IL 60051-4563
1(815) 385-2600

QUOTE: QU-79-
1063687-2

Quote Expiration:

www.knapheide.com 04/07/2026
Contact(s): Brett Wise (Outside Sales) Brett Wise (Inside Sales) Brett Wise
bwise58@knapheide.com bwise58 @knapheide.com bwise58@knapheide.com

Customer: Lombard, Village Of

ID: 87232
Address: 255 E WILSON AVE

ATTN: ACCOUNTS PAYABLE

LOMBARD, IL 60148-3926

Phone: 6306205919
Contact: Rob Lamontagna

Email: lamontagna@villageoflombard.org

Description: KC132H2094 Custom Body/Boss Compressor System/Lighting

Quote Information:

Customer Request Date:

Delivery Information:

Total Price Includes F.0.B.:

Quote Completed Date: 05/28/2026 Ship Via:
Date: 05/28/2026 14:11 PM CDT Ship To: Lombard, Village Of
# of Units: 1 6306205919

255 E WILSON AVE
ATTN: ACCOUNTS PAYABLE
LOMBARD, IL 60148-3926

Vehicle Information:

Make: Ford

Chassis Type: Chassis Cab
Rear Axle Type: DRW

Fuel Type: Gas

Model: F-550

Cab Type: Regular
Drivetrain: 4x2
Transmission Type: Auto

Terms: NET 30 DAYS
Bid Spec:

Year: 2026

Cab to Axle: 84
Engine Size: 7.3
Wheelbase: 169

GVWR: 19500
Seq. Description Quantity Total
1 1 N KC132H2094 Canopy Body 1.00 46,523.41
OVERALL LENGTH: - ------- 133-1/4" 1V = 34-1/4" in length x 54" high
OVERALL HEIGHT: - ------- 90" 2V = 21" in length x 40" HIGH
OVERALL WIDTH; = -------- 94" H = 52-3/4" in length x 18-1/2" high
FLOORWIDTH: == ==-u---- 54" 3V = 25-1/4" in length x 40" high
SIDE COMPARTMENT HEIGHT: - - - - 40" STANDARD SHELVING: Includes (2) adjustable
SIDE COMPARTMENT DEPTH: - - - - 20" divider shelves each front and 2nd vertical
FLOOR HEIGHT: - - ------- 24" compartment, (1) adjustable divider shelf
ROOF SIDE HEIGHT: ~ - -- - - - 50" each rear vertical compartment, (1) bolt-in

Quote 1063687-2

STREETSIDE COMPARTMENTATION: divider shelf for curbside horizontal

1V = 34-1/4" in length x 54" high compartment and (28) shelf dividers.

2V = 21" in length x 40" high (2) Fixed shelf per side, (1) on top of side pack

H = 52-3/4" in length x 18-1/2" high and (1) in the interior of tapered roof section
3V =25-1/4" in length x 40" high WARRANTY: Standard Knapheide Limited Warranty
CURBSIDE COMPARTMENTATION:

1Y Paint Knap White KC132 Interior and Exterior of body and cargo area painted
Knapheide white. Some touch up may be required by

distributor after shipment and handling.

1 N Ford 60"+CA Install Kit For use with wheel housing delete with 6" understructure.
1 N 2023 ford cab chas.fasfls

1Y Knapheide Power Locks Do not store flammable materials such as gasoline,
acetylene, propane, or cleaning fluids in body.

Electric locks may spark and cause an explosion which could

result in death or severe injury.

*Used in conjunction with standard master locks.

1 N LED Compartment Lights Shipped

1 N CR Side Mount Ladder Rack Side Mount

1 N Tailshelf w/Thru Comp 24" Tailshelf lowered so that doors can still operate.
1Y Tailshlf/Bmpr Vise Socket

1 N Tailshif/Bmpr Vise Table

1Y UB tailshlf hitch reinf.

KNAPHEIDE

SINCE 1348
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10
11

2 N Cable Step Galva Grip 15"
1Y 3PT T-Handle Latches ILO NXG Rotary Latches
STREETSIDE (Left)
1Y Transverse Comprtmnt L1V
1Y Extend Cargo Floor L1V Extend floor to edge of body. Leave compartment above and
below cargo floor.
1Y Roll Up Dr Vert Cmpt L1V aluminun shutter type door.
1Y Tb transverse top opn lid
1Y Raised Compart 54"H 1V Raise L1V 13" to fit Wach's
1Y Adjustable Shelf LH
CURBSIDE (Right)
1Y 22"D Comprts ILO 18"D R1V
1Y Roll Up Dr Vert Compt R1V aluminun shutter type door.
1 N Ctech 6 Drawer unit R2V 13w x 298.82h x 17.5d
Fire Engine Red
Telescoping Shelf
Shelf Slot Spacing : 8.75
MotionLatch Drawers
(3)3 inch [Liner]
(2)5 inch [Liner]
7 inch [Liner]
1Y Raised Compart 54"H R1V Standard shelving and shelf clips to remain.
11Y Tb add gas assists 1 pair add gas assists to transverse top opening compartment
2 1Y KC Roll Up Rear Door standard rear doors.
1 N Switch R1V and L1V This option switches the fransverse compartment and
floor extension to R1V and moves the 22"D to L1V
1Y KC Straight ILO Tapered sides. This option includes making the curb side rear
Installed

Boss PTO-Operated Under-Deck Air Compressor System with Hydraulic Too! Circuit & Hose Reel with Generator
and Wach's machine.

Chicago Style Air Fitting 1" Installed rea body

installed

LED Amber Lighting Package

15" Mini Lightbar Mounted in Front of Body

2- Front Grill

4- Rear of Body

4- LED Scene Lights. Two per side.

51" LED Directional Light Mounted on Top Rear Body
2-Flood Lights Mounted to rear of body

Installed

HOSE REEL HYDRAULIC 1/2 X 50FT
INSTALLED

Cone Holder, Buyers TCH10H

22" High

Horizontal Mount

Black Powder Coated Steel

Installed on Rear Bumper Street Side

Wall-Mounted Hanging Patio 1500W Infrared Heater
Installed Inside Body on Front Wall

Miscellaneous Material, Steel Hooks inside body

WACHS TM7 17-000-34 (8gmp @ 2000psi)
0 79-423-05 TC-110 controller

0 07-406-08 8" steel vaive key

o 07-508-20 Universal 2" H.D. U-Socket

Installation Labor to Install Customer Supplied Wachs Machine
Spray Liner, Rear Bumper Top and inside Load Space

6" Mechanics Vise, Wilton 746 Tradesman 21500
5,500lb Clamping Force

Base Type: Swivel

Powder Coated Paint

Jaw Material: Steel

Jaw Opening: 5-3/4"

Jaw Type: Serrated

Quote 1063687-2 KNAPHEIDE
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1.00

1.00

1.00

1.00

1.00

4.00
1.00

6.00
1.00
1.00

33,849.55

5,910.72

1,688.00

99.32

410.00

200.00
33,167.00

960.00
1,480.00
205.00
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Jaw Width: 8"

Material: Ductile iron

Mounting Type: Bolted-Down
Number of Mounting Points: 4

Pipe Capacity: 1/4" to 3-1/2"
Rotation Angle: 360 Degree
Throat Depth: 4-1/8"

17.7" Long x 11" Wide x 10.8" High
Weight: 69lbs

12 Electric Cord Reel 1.00 706.00
Installed in RR compartment

Total does not include any applicable taxes or transportation charges unless specifically noted herein: Subtotal: $125,289.00

Total: $125,289.00

Customer PO Total Price

*Credit Card Policy: Knapheide accepts MasterCard, American Express, Visa and Discover cards for payment. invoices greater than or equal to $10,000
will include a 3% handling fee when paid by credit card beginning May 4, 2026.

Liability for product on Knapheide property with terms Customer Pickup: Product must be picked up within (14) days of notification of product
available for customer pickup. Customer shall assume all responsibility for the Product, including but not limited to damage due to Acts of God or vandalism
following 14 days of notification of product available for Customer pickup. Knapheide reserves the right to assess a storage fee of $25/day for each day
goods remain on Knapheide property beyond (14) days of notification of product available for Customer pickup.

Cancellation Policy: Ali cancellation requests must be made in writing. Upon any request for cancellation, any costs incurred by Knapheide during the
fulfiltment of Orders placed pursuant to this Quote shall be paid at 100%. Payments for cancellation are due in full at time of canceliation and/or upon
cancellation of installation. Quoted prices are only guaranteed for orders placed as of the date specified on the Quote unless otherwise stated herein.

Payment Policy: Payment Terms are due upon receipt of signed quote unless prior credit agreement has been established at the time of order. Payment
terms for customers with an established credit account will be Net 30 from date of invoice. Seller has right to assess late charges at 1.5% per month on alt
invoices that are 60 days or more past due.

Pricing Policy: All prices reflect the latest price in U.S. Dollars. Any order placed pursuant to this Quote shall be subject to these Terms and Conditions
contained herein. These Conditions shall serve to exclude all other terms or conditions of purchase or other conflicting terms or conditions which may be
issued, provided or referred to by Customer, all of which are hereby disclaimed or rejected, except insofar as any terms are expressly accepted in writing
with an Authorized Knapheide Representative’s written signature. Pricing quoted applies to chassis make/model originally provided and quantity quoted.
Any deviation therefrom may result in price change. In addition, additional costs may be incurred in the process of fulfilling orders placed pursuant to this
Quote and Knapheide reserves the right to adjust costs accordingly, including but not limited to, reprogramming fees, etc. Orders are subject to all
applicable state, local and federal excise taxes. Applicable taxes will be applied on final billing to customer upon completion of order. Seller must be in
possession of the vehicle for this order within 90 days of quote acceptance or the order can be subject to price adjustments due to cost increases for
materials, labor, and shop supplies.

Return Policy: All sales are final. Purchased parts or products are non-returnable.

By signing and accepting this quotation, Customer agrees to accept Knapheide Truck Equipment Center Chicago terms and
conditions as stated above.

Customer Signature Print Name Title Date

Dealer Code Dealership Location

If the chassis is customer supplied, Knapheide
may require a chassis spec sheet

VIN

74
Quote 1063687-2 I\NAP“E'DE Page 3/3

SINCE 1248




